
Ojochal Modern Jungle Home with Infinity Pool & Mo - Listing ID: 40014899502

FOR SALE
$ 1,149,000.00 USD

Costa Rica - Puntarenas
Ojochal

Listing ID: 40014899502

A BRAND NEW, Stunning & Modern End-Of-The-Street
Jungle Home with Multiple Plantels, MAJESTIC Mountain
Views and Tropical Fruit Orchard on a BIG 4.7-Acre
Rainforest & River Lot in Ojochal’s Exclusive Finca Marañon
Neighborhood   Bitcoin – BTC – accepted as payment
method   HOME  Luxury, design, spaciousness & Pandora-
like views – this home stands out in every way. A grande
central nexus dominates the space holding the kitchen, living
area and dining room. Where to begin – the thoughtful
lumber & stone accents, ingenious layout, unique furniture,
maximum lightness & airiness, or maybe the unreal
mountain vistas? On one side, the modern & fully equipped
kitchen, with a gas stove and storage & counter space
galore, will make every meal an adventure. On the other
side, a stunning curved sofa snakes around the big-screen
TV which hangs, perched, on a lumber-panel wall. The
coffee table, made from several single-piece tree trunk
sections, is an art piece in itself. And in-between, a dining
table / kitchen island, with room for



 

SEE PROPERTY ON GOOGLE MAPS

https://www.google.com/maps/?q=9.072491221435163,-83.64143103485719


 

 

ZBIGNIEW BEN BODZAK
Sales Agent
506 87230795
ben@we-sell-paradise.com
http://www.we-sell-paradise.com

RE/MAX WE SELL PARADISE
read Highway #34, 50 meters north of the entrance to Ojochal, Costa Rica.

Each office is independently owned and operated
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