
Luxury Living in Manuel Antonio's Prestigious La R - Listing ID: 400201354288

FOR SALE
$ 3,850,000.00 USD

Costa Rica - Puntarenas
Quepos

Listing ID: 400201354288

Discover Casa Jasmine, a luxurious 10,000 sq. ft. estate
located in the exclusive La Reserva community of Manuel
Antonio, Costa Rica. This extraordinary property harmonizes
modern elegance with Costa Rica’s stunning natural beauty,
offering a private sanctuary amidst lush tropical jungles.
Casa Jasmine provides an unparalleled experience in
tropical luxury with seven spacious bedrooms, each
equipped with en-suite bathrooms, and meticulous finishes
throughout. Key Features: Expansive 10,000 sq. ft.
residence 7 bedrooms, 8.5 bathrooms Private maid’s
quarters Inf in i ty pool  wi th stunning jungle views
Sophisticated indoor-outdoor gym Secure gated entrance
with 24-hour security Modern appliances and covered
parking The crown jewel of this property is its grand infinity
pool, set against vibrant green vistas, creating a breathtaking
backdrop for gatherings or serene swims under the stars.
Designed with indoor-outdoor spaces that maximize
enjoyment of Costa Rica’s tropical weather, this home
includes a private gym, covered parking, and high-end
appliances. Community Highlights: Located in

SEE PROPERTY ON GOOGLE MAPS

https://www.google.com/maps/?q=9.4221475,-84.16157129999999
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