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FOR SALE
$ 799,000.00 USD

Panama - Bocas del Toro
Isla Cristobal

Listing ID: 003213999002

Acqua Lodge Marina & Spa – Luxury Eco Residences in
Bocas del Toro, Panama. Discover a unique opportunity to
own a luxury villa in Acqua Lodge Marina & Spa, an eco-
resort that blends modern architecture with the natural
beauty of the Caribbean rainforest. This exclusive project
features: 1. Luxury Villa with 2 with 2 bedrooms, 2
bathrooms, modern kitchen, and spacious living areas.2.
Private Dock with direct sea access (15 m).3. Exclusive
Amenities artificial lagoon & beach, pools, restaurant-bar,
spa, fitness center, yoga & meditation areas, and event
spaces.4. Eco-Luxury Design High-end finishes, panoramic
views of the jungle, canals, and Caribbean Sea. Set within
20 hectares of pristine nature, Acqua Lodge offers both
privacy and access to a vibrant resort lifestyle. Just 10
minutes by boat from Bocas del Toro International Airport,
the project is strategically located for tourism and
investment. Investment Highlight: Bocas del Toro has seen
annual tourism growth of 15% and high-season occupancy
rates of 90–100%. Properties here achieve an average ROI
of 10–14%, wit



SEE PROPERTY ON GOOGLE MAPS

https://www.google.com/maps/?q=9.287653452480342,-82.27831757622069


 
 

 

THOMAS TRIPIER
Sales Agent
507 69638987
thomas@remax-bocasdeltoro.com
https://www.remax-bocasdeltoro.com

RE/MAX ACQUA
Isla colon, Avenida B, frente ab isabel norte quinta Bocas del Toro
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